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Your attitude determines your altitude.”- Zig Ziglar 

If God gives you a watch, are you honoring Him 
more by asking Him what time it is or by simply  

consulting the watch?  A.W. Tozer

Heaven goes by favour. If it went by merit, you  
would stay out and your dog would go in. Mark  

Twain

Faith is to believe what we do not see, and the  
reward of this faith is to see what we believe.  

Augustine

Going to church no more makes you a Christian  
than standing in a garage makes you a car.  

Garrison Keillor

Prayer is simply a two-way conversation between  
you and God.  Billy Graham

In the Lord's Prayer, the first petition is for daily  
bread. No one can worship God or love his  

neighbor on an empty stomach. Woodrow Wilson

Beware in your prayers, above everything else, of  
limiting God, not only by unbelief, but by fancying  
that you know what He can do.  Andrew Murray

Don't let your worries get the best of you,  
remember, Moses started out as a basket case.  

Unknown



Prayer is a serious thing. We may be taken at our  
words. D.L. Moody Opportunity may knock once, but temptation bangs  

on your front door forever. Unknown

Faith activates God - Fear activates the Enemy.  
Joel Osteen

Be ye fishers of men. You catch them - He'll clean  
them. Unknown

We choose what attitudes we have right now. And  
it's a continuing choice.  John Maxwell

God doesn't call the qualified, He qualifies the  
called.  Unknown

What do you do when disappointment comes?  
When it weighs on you like a rock, you can either  

let it press you down until you become 
discouraged, even devastated, or you can use it as  

a stepping-stone to better things.  Joyce Meyer

You can tell how big a person is by what it takes to  
discourage him.  Unknown

Deny your weakness, and you will never realize  
God's strength in you. Joni Eareckson Tada 

Here's what you need to keep in mind. You no  
longer have yesterday. You do not yet have 

tomorrow. You have only today. This is the day the  
Lord has made. Live in it.  Max Lucado


